
 

VILLAGE OF SPRINGVILLE 

2016 MINUTES 

 

April 4, 2016   7:00 P. M. 

 

The Regular Meeting of the Trustees of the Village of Springville was held at the Village 

Municipal Building, 65 Franklin Street, Springville, New York at the above date and time.  

Present were: 

 

Mayor    William J. Krebs 

  

 Trustees    Alan L. Chamberlin 

     Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

     Terry W. Skelton 

     Nils A. Wikman  

    

 Village Administrator  Liz C. Melock  

 

 Village Attorney   Paul D. Weiss 

 

 Superintendent of 

 Public Works   Kenneth W. Kostowniak 

  

 Building Inspector/ 

 Code Enforcement  Michael Kaleta   

 

 Police Sergeant   John Fox 

 

 Clerk    Holly Murtiff 

 

 Also Attending   Colleen Mahoney, Springville Journal 

     Steve Buckley, MRC Disposal 

     Mike DeClerck, Waste Management 

 SGI High School students of Government Class & parents 

 

 Absent    Dennis Dains, Fire Chief 

  

Mayor Krebs called the meeting to order at 7:00 PM.  

 

1. Minutes  Minutes of the Regular Meeting of March 21, 2016  were approved as written  by motion 

of Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Trustees Wikman, 

Chamberlin, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none opposed. 

 

 Minutes of the Executive Session of March 21, 2016  were approved as written  by motion 

of Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Trustees Skelton, 

Chamberlin, Moriarty and  Wikman voting yes, none opposed. 

 

 PUBLIC COMMENT 

 

There was no public comment this evening. 

 

 PUBLIC HEARING 

 

2.  Intro Mayor Krebs opened the duly advertised Public Hearing to discuss Intro LL 2016-3 

     LL 2016-3 Procurement Policy change/deletion, shown below.  This will delete Chapter 28 from 
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 the Village Code and the Procurement Policy will approved annually at the Organizational 

Meeting. 

 

 VILLAGE OF SPRINGVILLE 

 PROCUREMENT POLICY 

 

 WHEREAS, Section 104-b of the New York State General Municipal Law 

requires the governing body of every municipality to adopt a procurement policy for all 

goods and services which are not required by law to be publicly bid, and 

  

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the VILLAGE OF 

SPRINGVILLE does hereby adopt the following procurement policy which is intended to 

apply to all goods and services which are not required by law to be publicly bid. 

 

PROCUREMENT POLICY FOR THE VILLAGE OF SPRINGVILLE 

 

1. Every purchase to be made must be initially reviewed to determine whether it is a 

purchase contract or a public works contract.  Once that determination is made, a good 

faith effort will be made to determine whether it is known or can reasonably be expected 

that the aggregate amount to be spent on the item of supply or service is not subject to 

competitive bidding, taking into account past purchases and the aggregate amount to be 

spent in a year.  The following items are not subject to competitive bidding pursuant to 

Section 103 of the General Municipal Law: purchase contracts under $20,000 and public 

works contracts under $35,000; emergency purchases; certain municipal hospital 

purchases; goods purchased from agencies for the blind or severely handicapped; goods 

purchased from correctional institutions; purchases under State and county contracts; and 

surplus and second-hand purchases from another governmental entity. 

 

The decision that a purchase is not subject to competitive bidding will be documented in 

writing by the individual making the purchase.  This documentation may include written 

or verbal quotes from vendors, a memo from the purchaser indicating how the decision 

was arrived at, a copy of the contract indicating the source which makes the item or 

service exempt, a memo from the purchaser detailing the circumstances which led to an 

emergency purchase, or any other written documentation that is appropriate. 

 

2. All goods and services will be secured by use of written requests for proposals, written 

quotations, verbal quotations, or any other method that assures that goods will be 

purchased at the lowest price and that favoritism will be avoided, except in the following 

circumstances: purchase contracts over $20,000 and public works contracts over $35,000; 

goods purchased from agencies for the blind or severely handicapped pursuant to Section 

175-b of the State Finance Law; goods purchased from correctional institutions pursuant 

to Section 186 of the Correction Law; purchases under State contracts pursuant to Section 

104 of the General Municipal Law; purchases under county contracts pursuant to Section 

103(3) of the General Municipal Law; or purchases pursuant to subdivision 6 and 7 of this 

policy: 

 

3. The following method of purchase will be used when required by this policy in order to 

achieve the highest savings: 

Estimated Amount   Method 

of Purchase Contract           

 

$1,000 - $2,999  2 verbal quotations 
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$3,000 - $19,999  3 written quotations or 3 written requests for proposals 

$20,000 and above Formally bid pursuant to Section 103 of NYS General  

   Municipal Law 

 

Estimated Amount   Method 

of Public Works Contract       

 

$1,000 - $2,999  2 verbal quotations 

$3,000 – $34,999  3 written quotations or 3 written requests for proposals 

$35,000 and above Formally bid pursuant to Section 103 of NYS General  

   Municipal Law 

 

A good faith effort shall be made to obtain the required number of proposals or quotations. 

If the Village purchaser is unable to obtain the required number of proposals or quotations, 

the purchaser will document the attempt made at obtaining the proposals.  In no event 

shall the failure to obtain the proposals be a bar to the procurement. 

4. Documentation is required of each action taken in connection with each procurement. 

 

5. Documentation and a detailed explanation are required whenever a contract is awarded 

to other than the lowest responsible offer.  This documentation will include an explanation 

of how the award will achieve savings or how the offer was not responsible.  A 

determination that the offer is not responsible shall be made by the purchaser and may not 

be challenged under any circumstances. 

 

6.  Pursuant to General Municipal Law Section 104-b(2)(f), the procurement policy may 

contain circumstances when, or types of procurement for which, in the sole discretion of 

the governing body, the solicitation of alternative proposals or quotations will not be in the 

best interest of the municipality.  In the following circumstances it may not be in the best 

interests of the VILLAGE OF SPRINGVILLE to solicit quotations or document the basis 

for not accepting the lowest  

bid: 

 

 a. Professional services or services requiring special or technical skill, training or 

expertise.  The individual or company must be chosen based on accountability, reliability, 

responsibility, skill, education and training, judgment, integrity, and moral worth.  These 

qualifications are not necessarily found in the individual or company that offers the lowest 

price and the nature of these services are such that they do not readily lend themselves to 

competitive procurement procedures. 

In determining whether a service fits into this category the BOARD OF TRUSTEES shall 

take into consideration the following guidelines: (a) whether the services are subject to 

State licensing or testing requirements; (b) whether substantial formal education or 

training is a necessary prerequisite to the performance of the services; and (c) whether the 

services require a personal relationship between the individual and municipal officials.  

Professional or technical services shall include but not be limited to the following: services 

of an attorney; services of a physician; technical services of an engineer engaged to 

prepare plans, maps and estimates; securing insurance coverage and/or services of an 

insurance broker; services of a certified public accountant; investment management 

services; printing services involving extensive writing, editing or art work; management of 

municipally owned property; and computer software or programming services for 

customized programs, or services involved in substantial modification and customizing of 

pre-packaged software. 
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 b. Emergency purchases pursuant to Section 103(4) of the General Municipal 

Law.  Due to the nature of this exception, these goods or services must be purchased 

immediately and a delay in order to seek alternate proposals may threaten the life, health,  

safety or welfare of the residents.  This section does not preclude alternate proposals if 

time permits. 

 

 c. Purchases of surplus and second-hand goods from any source.  If alternate 

proposals are required, the VILLAGE is precluded from purchasing surplus and second-

hand goods at auctions or through specific advertised sources where the best prices are 

usually obtained.  It is also difficult to try to compare prices of used goods and a lower 

price may indicate an older product. 

 

 d. Goods or services under $1000.  The time and documentation required to 

purchase through this policy may be more costly than the item itself and would therefore 

not be in the best interests of the taxpayer.  In addition, it is not likely that such de minimis 

contracts would be awarded based on favoritism. 

 

7. The Village, in accordance with subdivision 16 of General Municipal Law (GML) § 

103, is authorized to purchase apparatus, materials, equipment and supplies, and to 

contract for services related to the installation, maintenance or repair of those items, 

through the use of contracts let by the United States or any agency thereof, any state or 

any other political subdivision or district therein. The contract must be let in a manner that 

constitutes competitive bidding “consistent with state law,” and made available for use by 

other governmental entities. 

 

8. This policy shall go into effect immediately and will be reviewed annually. 

 
  After discussion, Mayor Krebs closed the Public Hearing. 

 

DEPARTMENT REPORTS 

 

ADMINISTRATOR REPORT 

 

3.  LL 2016-2 After discussion and with no further questions, motion was made by Trustee Chamberlin, 

seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, Trustees Chamberlin, Wikman, 

Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none opposed to adopt LL 2016-2 (attachment 040416 

A.1) the outline of which is shown below. 

 

Removal of Chapter 135 – Sewers 

 

Removal of Chapter 190 – Water 

 

Removal of Chapter 193 – Water, Sewer & Storm Drain Systems 

 

Replace old Chapter 193 with a new Chapter 193 – Village Utilities – changes in the new 

chapter include new drawings, removal of mentions of fees and billing procedures, 

changes to sewer portion where homeowner is responsible for sewer connection from 

building to sewer main, addition of electric section and supplements made to the water 

code.  Fees and rates will be set by Board resolution.  Billing procedures will be set by 

Administrator. 
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Amended Chapter 70 – Brush, Grass, Trees & Weeds – add section 70-4  A (3) – 

Properties that are known by the Village Administrator or designee to be abandoned and 

vacant at the beginning of April will have their lawns mowed by a contractor selected by 

the Village Board, through their annual bid process.  The lawns will be mowed every two 

weeks through the growing season.  The cost will be relevied onto the parcel’s Village tax 

bill. 

 

This local law shall take effect immediately upon filing with the Secretary of State. 

 

4.  LL 2016-3 Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Mayor 

  Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Chamberlin, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none opposed to  

adopting  LL 2016-3.  Chapter 28 (Procurement) will be deleted and adopted at 

reorganization every year.  New procurement policy changes will be by resolution.  The 

full LL 2016-3 is shown above in the Public Hearing section of these minutes.  

 

5.  Procurement Motion was made by Trustee Moriarty, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Mayor  

     Policy Krebs, Trustees Moriarty, Chamberlin, Skelton and Wikman voting yes, none opposed  

     Resolution to adopting the procurement policy shown in the Public Hearing section of these minutes. 

     2016-7 

 

6.  16/17 After discussion and there being no further questions motion was made by Trustee   

     Budget   Skelton, seconded by Trustee Moriarty; carried, Mayor Krebs, Trustees Skelton, 

Moriarty, Wikman and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed to set the 2016/2017 Village 

of Springville tax rate at $16.78 per thousand, representing a 1.799% increase over last 

year and to adopt the proposed 2016/2017 budget as follows: 

 
     General  Water    Sewer      Electric Total 

 

  Appropriations  3,089,044               1,119,180    729,288      3,685,780 8,623,292 

 
LESS 

Estimated Revenue  1,376,588              1,119,180    729,288      3,685,780 

Other Than 

Real Estate Taxes 

 

Reserve Fund Revenues                   0   0          0            0 

 

Appropriated Fund  

Balance               10,000    0          0             0 

 
Total Funding  

Sources                         1,386,588                1,119,180     729,288      3,685,780 

 
Less: 

Back Taxes                0 

 
Balance of Appropriations 

To be raised by Real 

Estate Tax Levy        1,702,346 
 

Taxable Valuation   101,457,449 

 
Tax Rate per $1000       $16.78 

 

Levy from 2015-2016      1,672,356 
 

% change from 2015-2016 levy     1.799 
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7.  Investment Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor  

     Policy Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed 

  to adopt the attached  investment policy (attachment 040416 A.2). 

 

8.  Garbage Bid    After discussion, motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; 

     Award carried, Mayor Krebs, Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes,  

       none opposed to award a three year collection and disposal of recyclable and non- 

      recyclable waste material contract to Waste Management.  The results of the bids are as 

follows; 

Alternate Proposal “A”  Waste Management Modern   MRC Disposal  

collection, hauling & disposal 

of waste Year 1  $172,050.00  $194,266.45  $177,950.00 

 Year 2  $176,351.28  $203,711.87  $181,509.00 

 Year 3  $180,360.00  $213,549.08  $185,139.18 

 

Alternate Proposal “B”   Waste Management Modern   NUWAY 

Item #1 collection of waste 

  Year 1  $147,150.00  $153,625.00  NO BID 

  Year 2  $150,825.00  $159,075.00  NO BID 

  Year 3  $154,600.00  $166,087.50  NO BID 

 

Item #2 Hauling & Disposal 

of waste  Year 1  $41,895.00  $42,826.00  NO BID 

  Year 2  $41,895.00  $44,688.00  NO BID 

  Year 3  $41,895.00  $46,550.00  NO BID 

 

Total Proposal “B” 

  Year 1  $189,045.00  $196,451.00  NO BID 

  Year 2  $192,720.00  $203,763.00  NO BID 

  Year 3  $196,495.00  $212,637.50  NO BID 
 

9.  Per Diem After discussion, motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman: 

     Policy carried, Mayor Krebs, Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, 

  none opposed to approving the below per diem policy. 

 

The Village of Springville will reimburse the following amounts for breakfast, lunch and 

dinner for employees or volunteer firefighters at seminars or training that was approved by 

their Department Head or Springville Volunteer Fire Department Fire Chief.  No 

reimbursement will be provided for alcohol, non-employees or any meals already included 

in the seminar or training cost. 

 

Breakfast = $9.00 per day, Lunch = $13 per day and Dinner = $27 per day.   

The employee or volunteer must submit itemized receipts for each meal they are 

requesting reimbursement for on the village approved voucher.  Reimbursement checks 

will be processed in a timely fashion and no later than the next regularly scheduled board 

meeting as long as all receipts are turned in by the Friday before the board meeting and the 

voucher is complete and signed. 

 

10.  Standard Motion was made by Trustee Moriarty, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Workday & Krebs, Trustees Moriarty, Skelton, Wikman and Chamberlin  voting yes, none opposed to  

Reporting  approving the Standard Workday & Reporting Resolutions as completed and shown  

Resolution below. 

2016-8 
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Standard Work Day and Reporting Resolution 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the _____Village of Springville_____________ hereby 

establishes the following as standard work days for elected and appointed officials and 

will report the following days worked to the New York State and Local Employees' 

Retirement System based on the record of activities maintained and submitted by these 

officials to the clerk of this body: 

 

 
Title 

 
Name 

 
Standard 

Work 
Day 

 
Standard  
Work Day  

 
(Hrs/day) 

 
Term 

Begins/Ends 

ELECTED 
OFFICIALS  

 
  

Village Trustee Nils Wikman 
 
6 2.5 4/4/16 – 4/6/20 

Village Trustee Alan Chamberlin 6 2 4/4/16 – 4/6/20 

Village Justice 
Kelly O’Neal 

Adams 
6 

4 
4/4/16 – 4/6/20 

 

APPOINTED 
OFFICIALS  

 
  

Administrator 
Elizabeth 
Melock 

8 
20 

4/4/16 – 4/6/20 
 

Village Attorney Paul Weiss 6 3.84 4/4/16 – 4/6/20 

 

11.  65 Franklin After discussion, motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee  

       Bid   Chamberlin; carried, Mayor Krebs, Trustee Skelton, Chamberlin, Moriarty and 

       Rejections Wikman voting yes, none opposed to rejecting any and all general contracting  

bids for the renovation project at 65 Franklin Street.  This project will be rebid in  

30 days and this will delay the project approximately 45 days. 

 

Administrator Melock took a moment to update everyone on the following; 

 The Village of Springville’s bond rating through S & P is an A+ stable (the same 

as before). 

 There will be a discussion at the next Board meeting on April 18
th

 regarding the 

park on Factory Street. 

 65 Franklin Street – borrowing, awarding contracts, etc. 

 Unpaid water/sewer bill as of April 21, 2016 will be added to Village tax bill due 

by July 1
st
. 

 Monopole at Control Center is having issues.  We are looking into repairing or 

replacing the pole.  Costs to replace are at about $50,000 and must be relocated 

away from power lines. 

  

SUPERINTENDENT REPORT 

 

  Superintendent Kostowniak informed everyone that the construction on the Rails-to-Trails 

  has begun. 
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12.  Resignation Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Moriarty; carried, Mayor  

  Krebs, Trustees Skelton, Moriarty, Chamberlin and Wikman voting yes, none opposed 

to accept the resignation of Gregory Hammond from the position of Apprentice Lineman 

“B” effective immediately.  Gregory Hammond will be paid in entirety for all comp time 

and vacation time accrued. 

 

POLICE DEPARTMENT 

 

Sergeant Fox updated everyone on the following; 

 The NYS monthly traffic ticket report for the month of March has been 

completed and forwarded to the NYSDMV. 

 The monthly mileage & tickets issued reports have been completed and are on 

file. 

 Two commercial vehicle safety checks are scheduled during the month of April 

with the assistance of the NYSDOT. 

 Monthly Activity Report from the Sheriff’s Department has not yet been 

received. 

 

FIRE REPORT 

 

There was no fire report this evening. 

 

       BUILDING INSPECTOR/CEO 

 

  BI/CEO Mike Kaleta informed the Mayor and Board of the following; 

 On March 9, 2016 the State Fire Prevention and Building Code Council 

completed major updates to the Uniform Fire Prevention and Building Code 

(Uniform Code) and State Energy Conservation Construction Code (Energy 

Code).  The Village of Springville will receive copies of the newly adopted 

Uniform Code and Energy Code books. 

 CO2 detector insert was placed with the April utility bills. 

 The property at 121 N. Buffalo St. that had a fire has been demolished and the 

clean-up has been hampered by the weather but is continuing.   

 There has been no response yet to his attempts to contact the owner of 128 

Waverly Street and it appears he will have to contact a contractor to clean up the 

property. 

   

13.  Building  Motion was made by Trustee Chamberlin, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor 

       Safety Krebs, Trustees Chamberlin, Wikman, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none opposed 

       Month  to supporting the May 2016 is Building Safety Month Proclamation issued by the  

      Proclamation International Code Council. 

 

14.  134  After discussion, motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; 

       Waverly Mayor Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Chamberlin, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none 

opposed to authorizing the below timeline regarding 134 Waverly Street and it’s possible 

demolition. 

May 15, 2016 – Date to have necessary repair made to structure or demolish it 

 

May 16, 2016 – If repairs or demo is not complete – Board will hire engineer to perform 

survey & report along with CEO (costs to be levied onto property tax bill if unpaid by 

owner of property) 

 

June 3, 2016 – Date survey and report must be completed 
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June 15, 2016 – Date completed survey and report is to be  

submitted to the Board – delivered to Clerk’s Office 

 

June 20, 2016 – If the report determines the structure is unsafe the Village Board will 

approve filing the necessary application to the Supreme Court in the Eight Judicial 

District. (attorney costs will be levied  onto the property if unpaid by owner of property) 

 

CONTROL CENTER 

   

  There was no Control Center report this evening. 

 

OLD BUSINESS 

  

There was no old business to discuss this evening. 

 

  NEW BUSINESS 

 

15.  Annual 

Appointments 

MAYORS APPOINTMENTS 2016-2017 
 

 Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed confirming the 

appointment by Mayor Krebs of the following Duties: 

 

  Deputy Mayor    Terry W. Skelton 

  Emergency Services Coordinator  Michael J. Willibey   

  Chairman, Union Negotiations  William J. Krebs 

  Deputy Chairman, Union Negotiations Terry W. Skelton 

  Trust and Agency    Nils Wikman 

  Acting Justice    Timothy P. Frank 

 

 Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs,  

 Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed confirming the 

 annual appointments by Mayor Krebs of the following duties; 

 

  Village Attorney    Paul Weiss 

  Village Prosecutor   Paul Weiss 

  Deputy Village Prosecutor       Yvonne Tripi 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed confirming the 

appointment by Mayor Krebs of the following Liaison Duties: 

 

  Electric Division    Terry W. Skelton   

  Fire Department    Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  Water and Sewer Division   Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  Wastewater Treatment Plant  Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  NEST     Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  Control Center    Alan L. Chamberlin 

  Youth Incorporated   Terry W. Skelton 

  Streets Division    Terry W. Skelton 

  Safety Committee   Terry W. Skelton 
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  Erie Co. Water Quality Committee  Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  Southtowns Planning and Dev. Group Nils Wikman 

  County Solid Waste Mgmt. Committee Robert J. Moriarty Jr. 

  Southtowns Scenic Byway   William J. Krebs   

  Health Insurance Committee  Nils Wikman 

  Erie/Cattaraugus Rails to Trails   William J. Krebs 

  Erie County Sheriff’s Department  William J. Krebs 

  Springville Police Department  William J. Krebs 

  Building Inspector/CEO   Nils Wikman 

  Village Office    William J. Krebs                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      

  Zoning/Planning Boards   Alan L. Chamberlin 

  Historic Preservation Commission  Nils Wikman 

  Springville Area Chamber of Commerce William J. Krebs 

  Pop Warner Trail Steering Committee Alan L. Chamberlin 

  Springville Property Rehab. Program Alan L. Chamberlin 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to naming Freed & 

Maxick, PC as the auditing firm for the Village of Springville. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to confirming the 

appointment of Elizabeth Melock as Administrator, Clerk/Treasurer for a term of April 5, 2016 to 

April 2, 2018. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Chamberlin, Wikman and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed, naming the 

Springville Journal as the official newspaper of the Village of Springville. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed, confirming the 

appointment by Mayor Krebs of David Batterson as Village Historian for the term April 5, 2016 to 

April 3, 2017. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed, confirming the 

appointment by Mayor Krebs of Darlene Schweikert as Official Registrar for the Village of 

Springville, for the term April 5, 2016 to April 3, 2017. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor Krebs, 

Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed, authorizing 

membership in and attendance at the following meetings, and payment of actual and necessary 

expenses thereof for the following, as amended: 

 

Annual Conference of Mayors  (NYCOM) 

Annual Municipal Electric Utilities Associates (MEUA) of New York State 

Annual New York Municipal Power Agency (NYMPA) 

 

Scheduled Meetings of: 

 

 American Public Power Association 

American Public Works Association 

American Water Works Association 
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Association of Erie County Governments 

 Association of Erie County Highway Superintendents 

Erie County Village Officials Association 

Erie/Cattaraugus Rails to Trails 

Erie County Water Quality Committee 

Governmental Finance Officers Association of New York State 

 Municipal Administrative Officers Association of Erie County 

Municipal Finance Officers Association 

National Trust Main Street 

 New York State Association of City and Village Clerks 

 Niagara Frontier Building Officials Association 

 Northeast-Southtowns Solid Waste Management Board (NEST) 

Organization of Public Employer Negotiators (OPEN) 

Pop Warner Trail Steering Committee 

Preservation League of NYS 

Southtowns Planning and Development Group 

Southern Tier West Local Government Annual Conference 

Southtowns Rural Preservation Co., Inc. (NYS Rural Preservation Program) 

Springville Area Chamber of Commerce 

Western New York Southtowns Scenic Byway Committee 

 

Other reasonable meetings of the Water Works Association, MEUA, 

NYMPA or Mayor’s Conference.  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed, 

adopting the VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES MEETING SCHEDULE for the June 

1, 2016, through May 31, 2017, fiscal year, as follows: 

 

  June 6, 2016    June 20, 2016 

 

    July 11, 2016    August 8, 2016  

  

    September 12, 2016   October 3, 2016 

     

October 17, 2016    November 7, 2016 

 

November 21, 2016   December 5, 2016 

 

December 19, 2016   January 3, 2017 * 

    *(Tuesday, New Year’s holiday) 

 

January 17, 2017 *   February 6, 2017 

*(Tuesday, MLK holiday) 

 

February 21, 2017 *   March 6, 2017 

*(Tuesday, President’s Day holiday) 

 

March 20, 2017    April 3, 2017  

   

April 17, 2017    May 1, 2017  

        

 May 15, 2017 
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In addition to the above regularly scheduled meetings, Special Meetings will be scheduled 

as needed, along with Joint Village Board/Town Council Meetings, Budget Work 

Meetings, Union Negotiations and Committee Assignment Meetings.  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Skelton, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Skelton, Wikman, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed, 

scheduling Village Board Meetings for the June 1, 2016 to May 31, 2017 fiscal year at 

7:00 PM. at 65 Franklin Street, Springville, New York.  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Chamberlin, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Chamberlin, Wikman, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none  opposed, 

confirming the appointment by the Board of Trustees of Robert Muhlbauer to the Planning 

Board as Chairman for a five (5) year term.      
 

Motion was made by Trustee Moriarty, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Moriarty, Skelton, Wikman and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed, 

confirming the appointment by the Board of Trustees of Sue Owen to the Zoning Board as 

Chairperson for a five (5) year term. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Moriarty, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Moriarty, Skelton, Chamberlin and Wikman voting yes, none     

opposed, confirming the appointment by the Board of Trustees of Helen Brogan to the 

Historic Preservation Commission as a member for a four (4) year term. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Chamberlin, Moriarty and Skelton voting yes, none opposed, to 

use Town of Concord Tax Assessment Roll so far as practicable for Village of Springville 

tax purposes. 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none   opposed, 

confirming the appointments by Mayor Krebs to the ADA Committee, as follows: 

     John Baronich 

     Dr. Robbin Hansen 

Timothy O’Neal 

Claudia Wolniewicz 

Terry Skelton, Chairman  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Moriarty and Chamberlin voting yes, none opposed to 

confirming the appointment by Mayor Krebs, of William Krebs as Affirmative Action 

Officer for the Village of Springville.  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting, yes, none opposed 

appointing Mayor William J. Krebs and Trustee Terry Skelton, as the 

discrimination/harassment committee for the Village of Springville.  

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to 

reimbursing mileage at .49 cents a mile.  
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BILLS 

 

Bills, as examined by members of the Board of Trustees were approved for payment in 

accordance with Abstracts #274 through #288, total of $173,540.24  of 2015/2016 for the 

General, Water/Sewer, Electric, Trust and Agency Funds by motion of Trustee Wikman, 

seconded by Trustee Chamberlin; carried Mayor Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Chamberlin, 

Skelton and Moriarty and voting yes, none opposed. 

 

CONSENT AGENDA 

 

Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to 

accept the consent agenda as follows:    

 

Building applications received by the Building Inspector/CEO Kaleta, Planning Board, 

Zoning Board of Appeal and Historic Preservation Commission as follows:   
 

2015/2016 Tax Relevy Payment from Erie County.   

 

PROJECT: 0000007679 - ACCESSORY BUILDING  TYPE:  ACCESSORY  

PROPERTY:       377 N BUFFALO ST   BUILDINGS 

ISSUED DATE:   3/18/2016     

ISSUED TO: PUFF, DUANE & JUDY 

377 N BUFFALO ST 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007680 - VIOLATION-TRASH                      TYPE:  VIOLATION 

PROPERTY:       217 WAVERLY ST 

ISSUED DATE:   3/21/2016     

ISSUED TO: WILLIBEY, MATTHEW J 

9205 GENESEE RD 

EAST CONCORD, NY 14055 

 

PROJECT: 0000007681 - ACCESSORY BUILDING             TYPE:  ACCESSORY  

PROPERTY:       140 SPRING ST    BUILDINGS 

ISSUED DATE:   3/21/2016     

ISSUED TO: GAMEL, JOHN J & AMY B 

140 SPRING ST 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007682 - DRIVEWAY              TYPE:  DRIVEWAY 

PROPERTY:       127 S CENTRAL AVE 

ISSUED DATE:   3/23/2016     

ISSUED TO: KRASNEK, RONALD 

127 S CENTRAL AVE 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007683 - NONRES NONSTRUCTURAL-PLUMBING TYPE:   

PROPERTY:       118 W MAIN ST        PLUMBING 

ISSUED DATE:   3/23/2016     

ISSUED TO: ADAMS, KELLY 

118 W MAIN ST 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 
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PROJECT: 0000007684 - NONRES NONSTRUCTURAL-PLUMBING TYPE:   

PROPERTY:        74 S CASCADE DR       PLUMBING 

ISSUED DATE:   3/23/2016     

ISSUED TO: CHEAP CHOLLIES 

74 S. CASCADE DRIVE 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007685 - ROOFING                                     TYPE:  ROOF 

PROPERTY:       329 WAVERLY ST 

ISSUED DATE:   3/23/2016     

ISSUED TO: AAA CONTRACTING SOLUTIONS, INC 

2392 GENESEE ST 

CHEEKTOWAGA, NY 14225 

 

PROJECT: 0000007686 - ACCESSORY BUILDING         TYPE:  ACCESSORY  

PROPERTY:       296 FRANKLIN ST  1   BUILDINGS   

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: JDB CONSTRUCTION, LLC 

27 NORTH DRIVE 

LACKAWANNA, NY 14218 

 

PROJECT: 0000007687 - ACCESSORY BUILDING          TYPE:  ACCESSORY  

PROPERTY:       312 W MAIN ST    BUILDINGS 

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: SCHUELER, ROBERT H 

312 W. MAIN ST. 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007688 - NONRES NONSTRUCTURAL-ELECTRIC TYPE:   

PROPERTY:       399 MILL ST     ELECTRIC 

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: SPRINGVILLE HARDWARE 

46 E MAIN ST 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007689 - VIOLATION-VEHICLE        TYPE:  VIOLATION 

PROPERTY:        79 ELM ST 

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: SHRIVER, CHARLES 

79 ELM ST 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

PROJECT: 0000007690 - DRIVEWAY                               TYPE:  DRIVEWAY 

PROPERTY:        36 S CENTRAL AVE 

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: DYGERT, MICHAEL 

36 S. CENTRAL AVE. 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 
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PROJECT: 0000007691 - DRIVEWAY                                TYPE:  DRIVEWAY 

PROPERTY:        90 RAUCH DR 

ISSUED DATE:   3/29/2016     

ISSUED TO: CANAVAN, WILLIAM 

90 RAUCH DR. 

SPRINGVILLE, NY 14141 

 

TRUSTEE NOTES & PROJECT REPORTS 

 

Trustee Chamberlin had nothing to report this evening. 

 

Trustee Wikman thanked the students for attending this evening. 

 

Trustee Moriarty had nothing to report this evening. 

 

Trustee Skelton reported that the Animal Code Committee will have their Mission 

Statement approved this Thursday (4/7/16). 

 

Mayor Krebs thanked the following people; 

 All involved with Rails-to-Trails, in particular Ken Kostowniak. 

 Those working on the planning of the proposed park on Franklin St. 

 BI/CEO Kaleta for all his hard work on distressed properties. 

 All those who serve on all the Boards within Village government. 

 

Mayor Krebs informed everyone that he is in receipt of a letter from a Grant Writer the 

help in obtaining a grant for the West Main Historic District.  Ten letters of support are 

needed, he will be working on this project. 

 

16.  Executive Motion was made by Trustee Chamberlin, seconded by Trustee Wikman; carried, Mayor 

       Session Krebs, Trustees Chamberlin, Wikman, Skelton and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to  

  adjourn to Executive Session at 8:04 pm to discuss legal matters. 

 

15.  Adjourn Motion was made by Trustee Wikman, seconded by Trustee Skelton; carried, Mayor 

Krebs, Trustees Wikman, Skelton, Chamberlin and Moriarty voting yes, none opposed to 

adjourn the Regular Session at 8:37  pm. 

 

Respectfully submitted,  

 

 

 

 

 

Holly Murtiff 

Deputy Clerk  


